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aqua

aqueous

aquarium

aquatint

aquatic

aqua vitae

aqueduct

aquifer
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1: WATER (aqua & hydra)

a container filled with water 
that holds fish, plants and other 

marine creatures

an etching that looks like a 
watercolor

water (Latin)

containing water or similar to 
water; watery

an elevated conduit for water, 
especially used in ancient 

Rome

an underground layer of rock 
or sand that can absorb and 

hold water

lives in or found near the water

a strong alcoholic liquor, such 
as brandy
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aquanaut

hydra

aqualung

hydrant

aquamarine

hydrangea

hydros

hydrate
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1: WATER (aqua & hydra)

1: WATER (aqua & hydra)

1: WATER (aqua & hydra)

a portable breathing 
apparatus for divers; a SCUBA 

tank

a pipe connected to a water 
source with a valve and spout; 

used to put out fires

a scuba diver who lives for a 
long while in an underwater 

shelter used as a base for 
research

mythological serpent with 
many heads; when one is cut 

off, two more appear

water (Greek)

to add water or moisture to 
something

a pale greenish-blue color

flowering bush with showy 
clusters of white, pink, or blue 

flowers; has a cup shaped 
seed pod
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anhydrous

hydrodipsia

hydraulic

hydronaut

hydrogen hydrophobia
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1: WATER (aqua & hydra)

1: WATER (aqua & hydra)

1: WATER (aqua & hydra)

operated by fluid or water 
pressure

a person trained to work in 
deep-sea vessels (other than 

a submarine) for research and 
rescue purposes

dry, without water

extreme thirst

fear of water simplest and lightest element; 
an essential part of water
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scribe

proscribe

inscribe

subscribe

circumscribe

conscript

prescription

transcribe
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2: WRITE (scribo & grapho)

2: WRITE (scribo & grapho)

2: WRITE (scribo & grapho)

to write or carve words into 
something permanently

to sign up to receive 
something regularly; to agree

a copier of documents, 
especially in ancient Israel of 

the Hebrew Scriptures; informal 
term for a journalist

to forbid; to make something 
illegal

written instructions from a 
doctor for the preparation of 
medicine or treatment; as a 
noun, refers to the medicine 

itself

to make a written copy of 
something

to limit or restrict by drawing a 
boundary around something

a draftee; someone forced to 
serve in the military
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scripture

biography

postscript

geography

graph

calligraphy

autograph

cacography
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2: WRITE (scribo & grapho)

a note appended to a 
completed letter, article, or 

book

an area of study that deals 
with the location of countries, 
cities, rivers, mountains, lakes, 
etc.; the natural features of a 

location

a sacred text, specifically the 
books of the Old and New 

Testaments

the story of a real person’s life 
written by someone else

a signature of a famous person

bad hand writing

a visual representation of 
a data set or mathemical 

equation to show relationships 
or connnections.

beautiful or decorative 
handwriting; elegant 

penmanship
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photograph

graphic

stenography

graphite graffiti
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2: WRITE (scribo & grapho)

2: WRITE (scribo & grapho)

2: WRITE (scribo & grapho)

2: WRITE (scribo & grapho)

writing or typing in shorthand a picture made by a camera

drawn with a picture or pen; a 
vivid visual, perhaps even too 
strong, as in graphic movies

unauthorized writing or 
drawing on a public surface black mineral used in pencils
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inter

terra incognita

terrier

terrarium

territory

terrestrial

terrain

extraterrestrial
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3: EARTH (terra & geo)

a small breed of dog originally 
trained to hunt burrowing 

animals living underground

a glass or plastic container for 
plants and small land animals, 

such as turtles and lizards

to bury a dead body

unknown land

a particular type of land and 
its unique characteristics

alien; coming from outside the 
Earth

area under the control of a 
person or government, usually 

land

relating to the Earth; an 
inhabitant of Earth
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terrace

geode

subterranean

geometry

geocentric

geodesic

heliocentric

geopolitics
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3: EARTH (terra & geo)

underground; hidden, secret

the branch of mathematics 
that deals with lines, surfaces, 

and solids

a flat area either on the side 
of a hill for farming, or near a 

building for relaxation

a stone having a cavity lined 
with crystals.

having or relating to the Sun as 
the center

the study of geographic and 
economic influences on power 

relationships in international 
politics

having or relating to the Earth 
as the center

relating to the geometry of 
the earth’s curved surface, 
specifically the shortest line 

between two points
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geology

perigee

 geophagy

geothermal

georgic apogee
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3: EARTH (terra & geo)

3: EARTH (terra & geo)

the practice of eating earth, 
dirt or clay

derived from the internal heat 
of the earth

the branch of science that 
deals with the structure and 

substance of the earth

the lowest point; the point 
in the moon’s orbit when it is 

nearest the earth

the highest point; the the point 
in the moon’s orbit when it is 

farthest from the earth
an agricultural poem
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multitude

multilateral

multifaceted

multilingual

multipartite

multiloquent

multifarious

multiped
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4: MANY (multus & poly)

4: MANY (multus & poly)

4: MANY (multus & poly)

4: MANY (multus & poly)

4: MANY (multus & poly)

4: MANY (multus & poly)

having many aspects

able to speak several 
languages

a large number of people, or 
things

having many sides; involving 
three or more nations in an 

agreement

diverse, or various

a creature with many feet

divided into many parts

using many words; talkative
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multiplicity

polynomial

multiplex

polymath

polygon

polydactyly 
polydactylia

polymer

polytheism
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4: MANY (multus & poly)

4: MANY (multus & poly)

4: MANY (multus & poly)

4: MANY (multus & poly)

having many interrelated 
features; a building with 
several movie theaters

someone who knows a lot 
about many different things

a large number, or variety, of 
things

consisting of many terms, 
usually used for math 

equations

a substance made from a 
large number of the same kind 

of simple molecules

belief in, or worship of, more 
than one god

a closed shape with many 
sides and angles

having more than the normal 
number of fingers or toes
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polyphony polyglot

polynesia polygraph
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speaks or writes many 
languages, usually more than 

three

a style of musical composition 
using two or more simultaneous 

but relatively independent 
melodic lines

a lie detector; works by 
graphically recording many 

physiological responses at the 
same time

a large collection of many 
islands in the South Pacific
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posit

depose

component

exponent

compose

expound

composition

exposition
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5: PLACE (ponere & thesis)

any of the parts of a machine, 
such as an engine or computer

number or symbol indicating a 
particular power or quantity; 

a person who supports 
something

put in a position, especially 
in terms of argument (used in 

logic)

to remove from office 
forcefully; in law, to bear 

witness

the structure of something, 
how something is put together

an interpretation or 
explanation, often as an article 

or commentary

to put together, especially to 
write, as in literature or in music

explain what is difficult or 
obscure
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impose

proposition

imposition

thesis

imposter

antithesis

juxtapose

epithet
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putting on laying something 
onto someone, esp. a demand 

or burden

the premise to be proved in an 
argument or paper

to apply authoritatively; to 
subject upon someone

act of proposing something; 
something put up for 

consideration; in logic, a 
premise or statement to be 

proved

place two or more things side 
by side or close to one another

a descriptive word or 
phrase for a person or thing; 
sometimes used offensively

a deceiver, one who takes 
on a false identity in order to 

decieve others

opposite, a complete contrast
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hypothesis

prosthesis

parenthesis

synthesis

photosynthesis

synthetic

polythetic
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a word, clause, or sentence 
inserted into a passage and 

set off by brackets; a rhetorical 
digression

the act of putting together 
parts or elements to make a 

complex whole; can also refer 
to what has been put together

an unproven idea or theory 
that is proposed, often leading 

to further investigation

an artificial replacement for a 
part of the body

a class of things having 
many, but not all properties in 

common

the process by which plants 
use sunlight to change carbon 

dioxide and water into food 
and oxygen

a chemical produced by 
artificial combination of parts 
into a whole in imitation of a 

natural substance
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temporary

atemporal

contemporary

tempo

extemporaneous

tense

temporal

contretemps
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6: TIME (tempus & chronus)
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6: TIME (tempus & chronus)

6: TIME (tempus & chronus)

6: TIME (tempus & chronus)

belonging to the same time; 
happening now

the speed at which something 
moves or happens, esp. music

lasting for a limited time; not 
permanent

free from the limits of time; 
timeless

relating to time or earthly 
life (as opposed to eternity); 

or civil life instead of 
ecclesiastical

an unexpected occurance or 
mishap, esp. an embarrassing 

one; also an argument

without preparation; 
impromptu

the form of a verb used 
to show when an action 

happened
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temporize

chronicle

tempest

chronicle

Chronos

chronology

crony

anachronism
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6: TIME (tempus & chronus)

6: TIME (tempus & chronus)

6: TIME (tempus & chronus)

6: TIME (tempus & chronus)

6: TIME (tempus & chronus)

6: TIME (tempus & chronus)

a violent storm; a violent 
commotion or disturbance

a lingering or repeating 
condition, often a disease

comply temporarily; also avoid 
committing so as to gain time, 

procrastinate

a detailed record of events in 
order of time

a close friend; sometimes one 
given special political favors

something or someone out of 
place with the current time

personification of time from 
Greek mythology, often as an 

old man

arrangement of events by 
dates and times of ocurrence
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synchronize diachronic

chronometer chronographer
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6: TIME (tempus & chronus)

6: TIME (tempus & chronus)

6: TIME (tempus & chronus)

6: TIME (tempus & chronus)

6: TIME (tempus & chronus)

6: TIME (tempus & chronus)

the way in which something, 
especially language, has 
changed through time

occur at the same time; 
coincide in time

one who writes concerning 
time or the events of time; a 

chronologer

an instrument for precisely 
measuing time
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bonus

bonhomie

bonanza

bounty

bonbon

debonair

bonny

bona fide
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7: GOOD (bonus & eu)

7: GOOD (bonus & eu)

7: GOOD (bonus & eu)

7: GOOD (bonus & eu)

7: GOOD (bonus & eu)

7: GOOD (bonus & eu)

a run of good luck

goodness; generosity; a gift, 
or reward; a monetary reward 

paid by the state

something unexpected, but 
welcome; a reward; extra; a 

dividend

cheerful friendliness; pleasant; 
good natured

handsome; beautiful; 
attractive

done in good faith; without 
deception; genuine   

a sweet

stylish; charming; suave; 
smooth; sophisticated
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pro bono

bon voyage

cui bono

bon apetite

summum bonum

bonjour

bounty hunter

euphoria
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7: GOOD (bonus & eu)

7: GOOD (bonus & eu)

7: GOOD (bonus & eu)

7: GOOD (bonus & eu)

utility, advantage, self-interest 
determines motivation

a salutation to a person about 
to eat

free legal work for someone 
with low income

used to express good wishes 
to someone about to go on a 

journey

one who pursues a criminal for 
the sake of the reward

a feeling of well-being, 
elation, intense excitement, or 

happiness

the highest good; the supreme 
good

good day



WordUp! The Vocab Show Flashcards

WordUp! The Vocab Show Flashcards

WordUp! The Vocab Show Flashcards

WordUp! The Vocab Show Flashcards

WordUp! The Vocab Show Flashcards

WordUp! The Vocab Show Flashcards

WordUp! The Vocab Show Flashcards

WordUp! The Vocab Show Flashcards

eugenics 
eugene

evangelist

euthanasia

eucalyptus

euphemism

eucharist

eulogy

euphony
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7: GOOD (bonus & eu)

7: GOOD (bonus & eu)

7: GOOD (bonus & eu)

the painless killing of a patient 
or animal suffering from an 

incurable and painful disease

a fast growing Australasian tree

the belief that human 
populations can be improved 

through selected breeding

a preacher or publisher of the 
gospel of Jesus Christ, licensed 

to preach, but not having 
charge of a particular church

a speech of praise for a 
deceased person

an agreeable sound; an easy, 
smooth enunciation of sounds; 
a pronunciation of letters and 
syllables which is pleasing to 

the ear

a mild, indirect expression in 
the place of a blunt expression

one of the sacraments, 
the central act of Christian 

worship, in which bread and 
wine are consumed as Christ’s 

body and blood, to be a 
memorial of his sacrifice on the 

cross
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eucatastrophe
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7: GOOD (bonus & eu)

7: GOOD (bonus & eu)

7: GOOD (bonus & eu)

7: GOOD (bonus & eu)

7: GOOD (bonus & eu)

a sudden and favorable 
resolution of events in a story; a 

happy ending
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advise

provide

clairvoyance

television

evident

visa

invisible

visor
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8: SEE (video & skopeo)

8: SEE (video & skopeo)

8: SEE (video & skopeo)

8: SEE (video & skopeo)

8: SEE (video & skopeo)

8: SEE (video & skopeo)

8: SEE (video & skopeo)

exceptional mental insight

an electronic device able to 
receive real-time visual and 

audio transmission

to give counsel; to caution; to 
offer an opinion

to make ready for future use; 
to prepare

not visible

the front part of a helmet; the 
stiff brim of a hat

obvious; clear; easily seen

a permit to enter another 
country
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survey

episcopal

supervise 
supervisor

borescope

scope

kaleidoscope

bishop

microscope
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8: SEE (video & skopeo)

8: SEE (video & skopeo)

8: SEE (video & skopeo)

8: SEE (video & skopeo)

8: SEE (video & skopeo)

8: SEE (video & skopeo)

8: SEE (video & skopeo)

to keep an eye on; to watch; 
to oversee the performance of 

a task

an optical instrument for 
seeing the inside of a tight 

structure, or for seeing through 
a small hole

noun: a detailed inspection; 
the act of looking; or, a short 
summary; verb: to inspect, to 
plot land; to keep an eye on

a branch of the Christian 
church governed by bishops

a spiritual overseer, 
superintendent, ruler, or 

director

an instrument that magnifies 
small objects

the breadth of a subject; 
a persons mental range; a 

device for aiming at a target; 
an abreviation for periscope, 
telescope, and microscope

a tube of mirrors containing 
colorful beads, when rotated, 
the kaleidoscope produces 
beautiful symetrical designs
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horoscope periscope

ophthalmoscope telescope
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a tool for peering over 
obstructions

in astrology, a future prediction 
based on stellar and planetary 

positions during your birth 
month

an instrument for viewing 
distant objects

a medical instrument for 
examining the retina of the eye
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abject

eject

adjective

interject

conjecture

inject

deject

jet
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in grammar, a word that 
modifies a noun

to introduce suddenly; to 
interrupt; interpose; to add; to 

insert introduce a new element

sunk to a low condition; cast 
down in spirit; without pride

to throw out; to expel; to 
discharge forcefully

to cast down; to depress; to 
dishearten

a rapid stream of liquid, or gas 
forced out of a small opening; 

an aircraft powered by jet 
engines

noun: an inference; a guess; 
a conclusion based on 

incomplete information; verb, 
to speculate, to guess

using a syringe, to force a 
liquid, drug, or vaccine into a 
person or animal; to drive or 

force into something else
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reject

ballistics

trajectory

discobolus

astrobleme

emblem

ballista

hyperbole
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the path of an object; a course 
of development

a discus thrower, or a statue of 
a discus thrower

verb: to ignore; to turn down; 
noun: something, or someone 

rejected, or tossed aside as 
unwanted

the science of the motion of 
projectiles

an ancient war machine, a 
large crossbow for firing a 

spear; stones, or other missles

extreme exaggeration, or 
overstatement

a crater on the earth’s surface 
formed by the impact of a 

comet or meteorite

a design that represents a 
group, or concept
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metabolism

ballistics

parable

problem symbol
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a story in which a lesson 
is expressed in terms of 

something else

the chemical processes that 
occur within a living organism 

in order to maintain life

extremely and suddenly 
excited, upset, or angry

a material object representing 
an abstract concept or quality

trouble, a roadblock, an 
obstacle, a difficulty
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urban

suburb 
suburbia

urbanite

urbanology

urbane

conurbation

urbanize

exurbs 
exurbia
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10: CITY (urbs & polis)

a city dweller

the study of urban issues, 
problems, and solutions

city-like

the area immediately outside 
the city

the formation of cities, or the 
gravitation toward cities

a residential area outside the 
city, beyond the suburbs

sophistcated, cultured, refined, 
polite

urban sprawl
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rurban

necropolis

urbacity

cosmopolitan 
cosmopolite

acropolis

polity

metropolis

politics
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excessive civic pride

familiar with and at ease in 
many different countries or 

cultures

a combination of elements 
from the city and the country

a large cemetery

a great commercial center, 
a large, densely populated 
urban center; the capitol, or 

chief city of a region; a major 
city; a city regarded as the 

center of activity

the art and science of 
government

the citadel, a stronghold on a 
high point in an ancient Greek 

city

the form or constitution of civil 
government of a nation or 

state
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politician police

megalopolis 
megapolis
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the force of officers charged 
with the protection of a city’s 

citizens and authorized to 
maintain the peace and safety 

of a community

an expert in politics

a chain of adjacent 
metropolitan areas



 LESSON 1 | WATER
aqua

aqua
aquarium
aquatic
aqueduct
aqueous
aquatint
aqua vitae
aquifer
aquanaut
aqualung
aqualung
aquamarine

hydra
hydros
hydra
hydrant
hydrangea
hydrate
anhydrous
hydraulic
hydrogen
hydrophobia
hydrodipsia
hydronaut

 LESSON 2 | WRITE
scribo

scribe
inscribe
circumscribe
prescription
proscribe
subscribe
conscript
transcribe
scripture
postscript

grapho
graph
autograph 

biography
geography
calligraphy
cacography
photograph
stenography
graphite
graffiti
graphic

 LESSON 3 | EARTH
terra

inter
terrier
territory
terrain
terra incognita
terrarium
terrestrial
extraterrestrial
terrace
subterranean

geo
geocentric
heliocentric
geode
geometry
geodesic
geopolitics
geology
geophagy
georgic
apogee
perigee
geothermal

 LESSON 4 | MANY
multus

multitude
multifaceted
multipartite
multifarious
multilateral
multilingual
multiloquent
multiped
multiplicity
multiplex

poly
polygon
polymer
polynomial
polymath
polydactyly; polydactylia
polytheism
polyphony
polyglot
polynesia
polygraph
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 LESSON 5 | PLACE 
ponere

posit
component
compose
composition
depose
exponent
expound
exposition
impose
imposition
imposter
juxtapose
proposition

thesis
thesis
antithesis
epithet
hypothesis
parenthesis
photosynthesis
polythetic
prosthesis
synthesis
synthetic

 LESSON 6 | TIME
tempus

temporary
contemporary
extemporaneous
temporal
atemporal
tempo
tense
contretemps
temporize
tempest

chronos
Chronos
crony
chronicle
chronicle
chronology
anachronism
synchronize
diachronic
chronometer
chronographer

 LESSON 7 | GOOD
bonus

bonus
bonanza
bonbon
bonny
bonhomie
bounty
debonair
bona fide
pro bono
cui bono
summum bonum
bounty hunter
bon voyage
bon apetite
bonjour

eu
euphoria
eugenics; eugene
euthanasia
euphemism
eulogy
evangelist
eucalyptus
eucharist
euphony
eucatastrophe

 LESSON 8 | SEE 
video

advise
clairvoyance
evident
invisible
provide
television
visa
visor
survey
supervise; supervisor

skopeo
scope
bishop
episcopal
borescope
kaleidoscope
microscope
horoscope
periscope
ophthalmoscope
telescope

 LESSON 9 | THROW
lacere

abject
adjective
conjecture
deject
eject
interject
inject
jet
reject
trajectory

ballein
astrobleme
ballista
ballistics
discobolus
emblem
hyperbole
metabolism
parable
problem
symbol
ballistics

 LESSON 10 | CITY
urbs

urban
urbanite
urbane
urbanize
suburb; suburbia
urbanology
conurbation
exurbs/exurbia
rurban
urbacity

polis
acropolis
metropolis
necropolis
cosmopolitan; cosmopolite
polity
politics
politician
police
megalopolis; megapolis
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